

(CCC) DHPs 2019 and 2020

(i) The total number of discretionary housing payments made by your council over the period April-December 2020

(ii) The total number of discretionary housing payments made by your council over the period April-December 2020 made to (i) private renters (ii) social renters

(iii) If available, the total number of discretionary housing payments per month made by your council over the period April-December 2020

(iv) The total amount in cash terms in issued discretionary housing payments over the period April-December 2020

(v) The total number of discretionary housing payments made by your council over the period April 2019 - March 2020

(vi) The total number of discretionary housing payments made by your council over the period April 2019 - March 2020 made to (i) private renters (ii) social renters

(vii) If available, the total number of discretionary housing payments per month made by your council over the period April 2019 - March 2020

(viii) The total amount in cash terms issued discretionary housing payments over the period April 2019 - March 2020

For order to be able to analyse your answer, I would be very grateful if your response could be made in the following form:

(i) The total number of discretionary housing payments made over the period April-December 2020 [or insert other relevant period] is [XXX]

(ii) The total number of discretionary housing payments made over the period April-December 2020 [or insert other relevant period] made to (i) private renters was [X] (ii) social renters was [X]

(iii) If available, the total number of discretionary housing payments per month made by your council over the period April-December 2020 [or insert other relevant period] is [April: X, May: X, June: X, July: X, Aug: X, Sept: X, Oct: X, Nov: X, Dec: X] [if not available, please answer n/a]

(iv) The total amount in cash terms issued in discretionary housing payments over the period April-December 2020 [or insert other relevant period] is £XXX

(v) The total number of discretionary housing payments made over the period April 2019 - March 2020 [or insert other relevant period] was [XXX]

(vi) The total number of discretionary housing payments made over the period April 2019 - March 2020 [or insert other relevant period] made to (i) private renters was [X] (ii) social renters was [X]

(vii) If available, the total number of discretionary housing payments per month made by your council over the period April 2019 - March 2020 [or insert other relevant period] was [April: X, May: X, June: X, July: X, Aug: X, Sept: X, Oct: X, Nov: X, Dec: X] [if not available, please answer n/a]

(viii) The total amount in cash terms issued in discretionary housing payments over the period April 2019 - March 2020 [or insert other relevant period] was

FOI Ref

8390

Response sent

29 Dec 2020

£XXX.

Response:

(i) The total number of discretionary housing payments made by your council over the period April-December 2020 - 381

(ii) The total number of discretionary housing payments made by your council over the period April-December 2020 made to (i) private renters (ii) social renters – data not held at that level.

(iii) If available, the total number of discretionary housing payments per month made by your council over the period April-December 2020 – please see the attached spreadsheet

(iv) The total amount in cash terms in issued discretionary housing payments over the period April-December 2020 - 172588.87

(v) The total number of discretionary housing payments made by your council over the period April 2019 - March 2020 - 479

(vi) The total number of discretionary housing payments made by your council over the period April 2019 - March 2020 made to (i) private renters (ii) social renters - data not held at that level.

(vii) If available, the total number of discretionary housing payments per month made by your council over the period April 2019 - March 2020 n/a

(viii) The total amount in cash terms issued discretionary housing payments over the period April 2019 - March 2020 - £237,821

Further queries on this matter should be directed to foi@cambridge.gov.uk