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(CCC) Temporary Accommodation/ Housing 
 
Q1. Of the households living with children in temporary accommodation at the end 
of December 2021 (the last quarterly data publicly available), how many were 
placed in accommodation outside of your local authority area? 
 
Q2. Of the households living with children in temporary accommodation in each of 
the following financial years, how many were placed in accommodation outside of 
your local authority area? 
a. 2017/2018 
b. 2018/2019 
c. 2019/2020 
d. 2020/2021 
e. 2021/2022 
 
Q3. For the households with children who left a placement in B&B/ hotel 
accommodation during each of the following financial years, what was the 
average time spent in B&B/hotel accommodation? 
a. 2017/2018 
b. 2018/2019 
c. 2019/2020 
d. 2020/2021 
e. 2021/2022 
 
Response 
 
Q1. 2 though one is technically outside the city boundary but within the built up 
area of the city. 
 
Q2. 
2017/18 Data not held 
2018/19 11 
2019/20 29 
2020/21 19 
2021/22 26 
 
Q3. 
2017/18 Data not held 
2018/19 6 days 
2019/20 12 days 
2020/21 11 days 
2021/22 12 days 
We aim to provide a high-quality service to you and hope that you are satisfied 
with this response. If you have any further questions, please do not hesitate to 
contact us. 
 

 Further queries on this matter should be directed to foi@cambridge.gov.uk 
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