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(CCC) Employee working patterns

Q1: How many people were employed Cambridge City Council Mandela House
Offices in the last full week of November 2019?

Q2: How many of those employed in November 2019 were;
On flexible hours?

Were working from home;

1 day per week?

2 days per week?

3 days per week?

4 days per week?

5 days per week?

Q3: How many people were employed at the Cambridge City Council Mandela
House Offices in the last full week of March 20227

Q4:How many of those employed in March 2022 were;
On flexible hours?

Were working from home;

1 day per week?

2 days per week?

3 days per week?

4 days per week?

5 days per week?
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Q5: What is Cambridge City Council’s policy on working from home post the
pandemic?

Response

Q1: How many people were employed Cambridge City Council Mandela House
Offices in the last full week of November 20197?

Approximately 228 had an office base of Mandela House

Q2: How many of those employed in November 2019 were; On flexible hours?
Were working from home; 1 day per week? 2 days per week? 3 days per week? 4
days per week? 5 days per week?

We do not hold this information in this format. We do not record number of days
working from home or in office/on-site/other location

Q3: How many people were employed at the Cambridge City Council Mandela
House Offices in the last full week of March 20227

Approximately 221 have a office base indicated as Mandela House — This is
different to actual occupancy

Q4: How many of those employed in March 2022 were; On flexible hours? Were
working from home; 1 day per week? 2 days per week? 3 days per week? 4 days
per week? 5 days per week?

We do not hold this information in this format. We do not record number of days
working from home or in office/on-site/other location

Q5: What is Cambridge City Council’s policy on working from home post the
pandemic?

We have adopted a flexible office base arrangement where flexible working
arrangements are encouraged and should be informed by business need.
Operational staff continue to be based from their work locations.

We aim to provide a high-quality service to you and hope that you are satisfied
with this response. If you have any further questions, please do not hesitate to
contact us.

Further queries on this matter should be directed to foi@cambridge.gov.uk
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